
MACON-BIBB COUNTY PROCUREMENT

OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT:  Economic Community Development (ECD) BID DATE: February 12, 2026

BID FOR: Pine Hill Sidewalk Improvement BID TIME:  2:00:00 PM

BID # 26-033-LH

RED SQUIREL

WALKER'S 

GENERAL 

CONTRACTING

Butler's Home 

Improvement

CGS 

WATERPROOFING 
Just Roofing Bryant Roofing

ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 1530 Anthony Road NON RESPONSIVE $6,900.00 $6,300.00 $7,798.59 $9,689.85 $9,860.00

2 2842 Kent Drive NON RESPONSIVE $6,900.00 $7,100.00 $8,304.66 $10,228.82 NO BID

3 1334 Long Acre Drive NON RESPONSIVE $8,600.00 $7,950.00 $9,097.03 $10,752.81 $10,800.00

4 1063 Dennis Street NON RESPONSIVE $6,000.00 $5,100.00 $11,388.50 $19,199.99 NO BID

5 1325 Sylvian Drive NON RESPONSIVE $9,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,197.14 $11,476.99 $10,070.00

6 633 Oakland Hills Road NON RESPONSIVE $9,900.00 $11,000.00 $9,190.48 $11,652.80 $11,110.00

7 936 Curry Drive NON RESPONSIVE $9,750.00 $9,300.00 $10,350.09 NO BID NO BID

8 2991 Millerfield Road NON RESPONSIVE $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $6,574.16 $7,980.80 NO BID

9 1381 Earnest Street NON RESPONSIVE $5,900.00 $5,500.00 $12,310.94 $15,989.99 $10,495.00

10 4011 Jones Street NON RESPONSIVE $13,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,858.13 $15,784.80 $14,500.00

11 4641 Savage Hills Drive NON RESPONSIVE $13,000.00 $12,000.00 $14,365.65 $17,299.98 $18,650.00

12 541 Villa Crest Avenue NON RESPONSIVE $7,100.00 $7,400.00 $9,357.16 $15,899.99 NO BID

13 3920 Marse Allen Road NON RESPONSIVE $8,600.00 $7,800.00 $10,382.45 $14,899.99 NO BID

14 1314 Brinwood Drive NON RESPONSIVE $11,200.00 $11,000.00 $11,320.04 $18,999.99 NO BID

15 3939 Vinson Robeson Drive NON RESPONSIVE $9,800.00 $9,700.00 $8,902.68 $10,618.65 $11,450.00

16 2961 Jaden Place NON RESPONSIVE $5,100.00 $5,700.00 $9,432.44 $7,780.89 NO BID

17 553 Lynmore Circle NON RESPONSIVE $9,300.00 $9,900.00 $13,638.96 NO BID NO BID

18 3041 O'Hara Drive North NON RESPONSIVE $8,800.00 $8,300.00 $10,052.61 $10,382.40 NO BID

19 2810 Alta Vista Ave NON RESPONSIVE $6,900.00 $6,800.00 $8,359.27 $11,280.82 NO BID 

20 266 Poppy Avenue NON RESPONSIVE $5,700.00 $6,300.00 $6,471.90 $11,042.82 $8,800.00

TOTALS $0.00 $168,350.00 $165,550.00 $199,352.88 $230,962.38 $105,735.00

Bid Qualification Form YES YES YES YES YES

List of Sub-Contractors YES YES YES YES YES

Bidder Minority Participation Goal YES YES YES YES YES

Financial & Legal Stability Statement YES YES YES YES YES

Insurability Statement YES YES YES YES YES

Certication Regarding Debarment, 

Suspension, Ineligibilety YES YES YES YES YES

Non Collusion Afficavit YES YES YES YES YES

Macon-Bibb County Vendor Application YES YES YES YES YES

Form W-9 YES YES YES YES YES

E-Verify Affidavit YES YES YES YES YES

Vendor Type A C E F F

                             

I certify that this is a correct tabulation of bid received and opened at the time and place as stated in the bid notice. 

 I also certify that I have personally and visually checked the tabulation against the proposal forms submitted.

BY: _________________________________________________________________________Nan Tharpe
Vendor Type:                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               

A. Local Minority Owned Business E. Non-Local Minority Owned Business I. Non-Profit Organization

B. Local Non-Minority Owned Business F. Non-Local Non-Minority Owned Business J. Failed to Identify

C. Local Woman Owned Business G. Non-Local Woman Owned Business

D. Local Disadvantaged Business H. Non-Local Disadvantaged Business

Submittals (Yes, No, N/A)

  Bid is to be awarded based on THIS INFORMATION IS TO BE EXTRACTED FROM THE BID DOCUMENT.


