MACON-BIBB COUNTY PROCUREMENT
OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: Economic Community Development (ECD) BID DATE: February 12, 2026

BID FOR: Pine Hill Sidewalk Improvement
BID # 26-033-LH

BID TIME: 2:00:00 PM

. Complete
s | o | s, [ smesmee T cowoorn [omesscarma
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 1530 Anthony Road $7,200.00 $14,833.06 NO BID $11,563.89 $8,500.00 $7,600.00
2 2842 Kent Drive $8,000.00 $12,517.51 NON RESPONSIVE $11,805.77 $8,750.00 $7.800.00
3 1334 Long Acre Drive $8,500.00 $13,095.18 NON RESPONSIVE $10,954.00 $9,900.00 $8,600.00
4 1063 Dennis Street $7,300.00 $13,400.10 NO BID $13,581.17 NO BID $6,000.00
5 1325 Sylvian Drive $10,000.00 $13,015.09 NON RESPONSIVE $12,101 32| $13,200.00 $8,400.00
6 633 Oakland Hills Road $9,600.00 $13,380.26 NON RESPONSIVE $11,310.99 $9,900.00 $10,500.00
7 936 Curry Drive $9,800.00 $12,773.25 $15,641.50 $12,918.57 $1 2,650_00| $10,000.00
8 2991 Millerfield Road $7.200.00 $8,738.69 $11,009.00 $9,348.87 $7.390.00 $6.300.00
9 1381 Earnest Street $8,300.00 $13,196.45 SQ,B{)O_DOI $11,960.37 $13,300.00 $6,000.00
10_|4011 Jones Street $12,042.00 $15,824.99 $13,897.50 $15,049. 03| $13,600.00 $13,500.00
11_|4641 Savage Hills Drive $14,100.00 $19,510.84 $19,193.81 $16,708.08 $15,500.00 $13,000.00
12 |541 Villa Crest Avenue $10,400.00 $14,264.25 $11,024.00 $14,439.99) $10,720.00 $6,600.00
13 13920 Marse Allen Road $9,200.00 $17,398. Sj NO BID $15,920.35) $13,300.00 $8,800.00
14 _|1314 Brinwood Drive $9.700.00 $22,448.65 NO BID $21,121.27 NO BID $18,000.00
15 13939 Vinson Robeson Drive $8,700.00 $13,126.05 NO BID $9,976.00 $8,900.00 $9,000.00
16_|2961 Jaden Place $7.300.00 $11,116.98 NO BID $10,616. 95| $5.,800.00 $6,000.00
17_|553 Lynmore Circle $15,300.00 $15,398.25 NO BID $20,401.07 $13,900.00 $10,000.00
18 |3041 O'Hara Drive North $9,000.00 $16,597.12 $11,826.50 $15,229.78 $9,900.00 $9.000.00
19 2810 Alta Vista Ave $7,650.00 $10,059.00 $14,m $13,459.64 $9,035.00 $6,300.00

1
S

266 Poppy Avenue $6,600.00 $9,503.51 $10,918.00 $10,302.73 $8,000.00 $6,300.00
TOTALS $185,892.00 $280,197.73 $118,458.31 $268,769.84 $192,245.00 $177,700.00

Bid is to be awarded based on THIS INFORMATION IS TO BE EXTRACTED FROM THE BID DOCUMENT.

Submittals (Yes, No, N/A)

Bid Qualification Form YES YES YES YES YES YES
List of Sub-Contractor: YES YES YES YES YES YES
Bidder Minority Participation Goal YES YES YES YES YES YES
Financial & Legal Stability Statement YES YES YES YES YES YES
Insurability Statement YES YES YES YES YES YES
Certication Regarding Debarment,
S i gibil YES YES YES YES YES YES
Non Collusion Afficavit YES YES YES YES YES YES
Macon-Bibb County Vendor Application YES NO YES YES YES YES
Form W-9 YES YES YES YES YES YES
E-Verify Affidavit YES YES YES YES YES YES
Vendor Type E F F E J A

1 certify that this is a correet tabulation of bid received and opened at the time and place as stated in the bid notice.

Talso certify that I have personally and visually checked the tabulation against the proposal forms subitted.

BY: /Ml/{ ﬂdf/e

Vendor Type:

A. Local Minority Owned Busi
B. Local Non-Minority Owned Business
C. Local Woman Owned Business
D. Local Disadvantaged Business

ocal Minority Owned Business 1. Non-Profit Organization
F. Non-Local Non-Minority Owned Business 1. Failed to Identify

G. Non-Local Woman Owned Business

H. Non-Local Disadvantaged Business




