
MACON-BIBB COUNTY PROCUREMENT
OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: ECD BID DATE: 5/12/2022

BID FOR:  (20) Homes Roof Repair BID TIME: 2:00 PM

BID # 22-054-NT

ITEM QTY U/M DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 1 2280 Robin Hood Road 12,500.00$                     20,342.03$               6,440.00$                       9,700.00$                       9,440.00$                       10,650.00$                     

2 1 3267 Masseyville Road 12,000.00$                     No Bid 7,300.00$                       5,100.00$                       5,300.00$                       10,250.00$                     

3 1 823 Perry Drive No Bid No Bid 16,000.00$                     10,920.00$                     11,200.00$                     12,250.00$                     

4 1 4165 San Carlos Drive 10,700.00$                     20,182.11$               13,000.00$                     4,800.00$                       5,000.00$                       9,750.00$                       

5 1 4112 W. Hickory Court 11,500.00$                     No Bid 5,750.00$                       6,875.00$                       6,320.00$                       9,800.00$                       

6 1 1955 Canterbury Road 10,500.00$                     No Bid 5,980.00$                       6,750.00$                       6,400.00$                       8,450.00$                       

7 1 1172 East Cordele Ave 7,500.00$                       No Bid 12,000.00$                     4,250.00$                       4,390.00$                       5,500.00$                       

8 1 5821 East Ocmulgee Blvd No Bid No Bid 12,000.00$                     14,000.00$                     14,200.00$                     13,300.00$                     

9 1 908 Quinlan Drive 12,000.00$                     18,554.85$               7,600.00$                       5,600.00$                       5,810.00$                       10,200.00$                     

10 1 3500 Doster Way 7,000.00$                       No Bid 10,000.00$                     3,900.00$                       4,300.00$                       5,000.00$                       

11 1 3950 Bloomfield Drive 16,000.00$                     20,792.86$               18,000.00$                     18,650.00$                     15,940.00$                     13,950.00$                     

12 1 5541 Jeffersonville Road 14,500.00$                     No Bid 13,000.00$                     8,950.00$                       9,160.00$                       13,900.00$                     

13 1 2990 Hester Road 10,500.00$                     19,524.76$               8,330.00$                       5,555.00$                       5,800.00$                       11,100.00$                     

14 1 2276 Houston Avenue 16,000.00$                     No Bid 8,330.00$                       10,865.00$                     11,964.00$                     18,000.00$                     

15 1 4928 Pinefiled Drive 10,500.00$                     13,411.96$               7,000.00$                       5,650.00$                       5,250.00$                       9,000.00$                       

16 1 3983 Marse Allen Road 15,750.00$                     No Bid 8,520.00$                       6,970.00$                       6,750.00$                       11,600.00$                     

17 1 2574 Medford Place 9,000.00$                       No Bid 7,500.00$                       5,275.00$                       5,000.00$                       9,375.00$                       

18 1 835 Plant Street No Bid No Bid 13,000.00$                     20,965.00$                     21,375.00$                     16,600.00$                     

19 1 1097 Lamont Street No Bid 19,465.48$               8,610.00$                       7,400.00$                       7,600.00$                       12,800.00$                     

20 1 1070 Maynard Street 10,500.00$                     18,532.42$               10,000.00$                     7,100.00$                       7,295.00$                       8,505.00$                       

TOTALS $186,450.00 $150,806.47 198,360.00$        169,275.00$        168,494.00$        219,980.00$        

Bid Form Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addendum Acknowledged Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder's Qualification Form Yes NO Yes Yes Yes Yes

List of Sub-Contractors Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Minority Participation Goal Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Legal & Financial Stability Affidavit Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond (5% of total base bid) Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

E-Verify Affidavit Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Title VI non-discrimination Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Vendor Type F N/A A A A F
                             

I certify that this is a correct tabulation of bid received and opened at the time and place as stated in the bid notice. 

 I also certify that I have personally and visually checked the tabulation against the proposal forms submitted.

BY: _______________Nan Tharpe
Vendor Type:                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               
A. Local Minority Owned Business E. Non-Local Minority Owned Business I. Non-Profit Organization
B. Local Non-Minority Owned Business F. Non-Local Non-Minority Owned Business J. Failed to Identify
C. Local Woman Owned Business G. Non-Local Woman Owned Business
D. Local Disadvantaged Business H. Non-Local Disadvantaged Business

Butler Homes Improvement & 
Roofing

Walkers General Contracting 
INC Go-Cleanco

Submittals (Yes, No, N/A)

  Bid is to be awarded based on THIS INFORMATION IS TO BE EXTRACTED FROM THE BID DOCUMENT.

Ideal Exterior Solutions Paul Davis Genesis Capital Management INC


	Tabulation

