MACON-BIEB COUNTY PROCUREMENT

OFFICIAL BID TABULATICN

DEPARTMENT: Recreation BID DATE: 2/23/2017
BID FOR: Reno of Freedom Park BID TIME: 2:00 PM
1CB Peed Brothers Sports Turf Warren and Associates Vendor #5 Vendor #6
ITEM| QTY | UM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 Total Bid Price 3 4.110,000.00 $ 4.261.367.33 S 5,042.284.00 § 4,289,000.00
2
3 Alt #1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Al #2 S £0,000.00 S 88,000.00 $ = $ 78.000.00
5 Alt #3 Deduct 3 (353,485.00) S (325.000.00) S - S (344,000.00)
TOTALS $  3.816,515.00 $ 4.024,367.33 . $  5.042.284.00 S 4,023,000.00 | - St - $
Bid is to be awarded based on THIS INFORMATION 1S TO BE EXTRACTED FROM THE BID DOCUMENT.
Submittals (Yes, No, N/A)
Bid Form yes yes yes ves
Addendum Acknowledged ves ves ves ves
Bidder's Qualification Form ves ves ves ves
List of Sub-Contractors yes yes ves ves
Minoritv Participation Goal ves ves ves ves
Legal & Financial Stability Affidavit ves ves ves ves
Bid Bond (5% of total base bid) ves ves yes ves
E-Verify Affidavit ves ves yes yes
Title VI non-discrimination ves ves ves ves
Vendor Tvpe B F F B

I centify that this is a correct tabulation of bid received and opened at the time and place as stated in the bid notice.

1 also certify that [

BY:
Vendor Tvpe:

the proposal forms submitted.
L4

¢ personally and visually checked the labuk\f': ngn:’:

A. Local Minority Owned Business
B. Local Non-Minority Owned Business
€. Local Woman Owned Business

D. Local Disadvantaged Business

E. Non-Local Minority Owned Business

F. Non-Local Non-Minority Owned Business
G. Non-Local Woman Owned Business

H. Non-Local Disadvantaged Business

1. Non-Profit Organization
J. Failed to Identify




