

MACON-BIBB COUNTY PROCUREMENT
OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF DEPARTMENT
 BID FOR: 16-025-KMB VEHICLES

BID DATE: 12/17/2015
 BID TIME: 2:00 PM

ITEM	QTY	U/M	DESCRIPTION	DON JACKSON		RIVERSIDE FORD LINCOLN		Vendor #3		UNIT PRICE
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
1	1	ea	15 Passenger Van (Low)	\$ 33,603.00	\$ 33,603.00	\$ 29,779.48	\$ 29,779.48			
2	2	ea	15 Passenger Van (Raised)	\$ 35,408.00	\$ 70,816.00	\$ 31,130.48	\$ 62,260.96			
3	6	ea	Passenger Cars	\$ 21,551.00	\$ 129,306.00	\$ 21,575.74	\$ 129,454.44			
4	6	ea	Passenger Cars 4 door	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19,186.74	\$ 115,120.44			
4	16	ea	Police Interceptor (2015-2016 Sedan	\$ 23,991.00	\$ 383,856.00	\$ 25,730.74	\$ 411,691.84			
5	1	ea	12 Passenger Van/Low Top Van	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28,980.48	\$ 28,980.48			
6	1	ea	12 Panenger Van/Raised Top Van	\$ 31,349.00	\$ 31,349.00	\$ 30,331.48	\$ 30,331.48			
7	1	ea	Interceptor SUV	\$ 30,704.00	\$ 30,704.00	\$ 29,060.74	\$ 29,060.74			
TOTALS					\$ 679,634.00		\$ 836,679.86		\$ -	

Bid is to be awarded based on Total Price.

Submittals (Yes, No, N/A)						
Bid Form		YES		NO		
Bidder's Qualification Form		YES		NO		
List of Sub-Contractors		YES		NO		
Minority Participation Goal		YES		NO		
Legal & Financial Stability Affidavit		YES		NO		
E-Verify Affidavit		YES		NO		
Vendor Type		B		B		

I certify that this is a correct tabulation of bid received and opened a E. Non-Local Minority Owned Business

I. Non-Profit Organization

I also certify that I have personally and visually checked the tabulat F. Non-Local Non-Minority Owned Business

J. Failed to Identify

BY: _____ G. Non-Local Woman Owned Business

Vendor Type: _____ H. Non-Local Disadvantaged Business

- A. Local Minority Owned Business
- B. Local Non-Minority Owned Business
- C. Local Woman Owned Business
- D. Local Disadvantaged Business

MACON-BIBB COUNTY PROCUREMENT
OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF DEPARTMENT

BID FOR: 16-025-KMB VEHICLES

ITEM	QTY	U/M	DESCRIPTION	Vendor #4		Vendor #5		Vendor #6	
				TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	1	ea	15 Passenger Van (Low)						
2	2	ea	15 Passenger Van (Raised)						
3	6	ea	Passenger Cars						
4	6	ea	Passenger Cars 4 door						
4	16	ea	Police Interceptor (2015-2016 Sedan						
5	1	ea	12 Passenger Van/Low Top Van						
6	1	ea	12 Passenger Van/Raised Top Van						
7	1	ea	Interceptor SUV						
TOTALS				\$ -		\$ -		\$ -	
Bid Form									
Bidder's Qualification Form									
List of Sub-Contractors									
Minority Participation Goal									
Legal & Financial Stability Affidavit									
E-Verify Affidavit									
Vendor Type									

I certify that this is a correct tabulation of bid received and opened a

I also certify that I have personally and visually checked the tabulation

BY: _____

Type: _____

- Minority Owned Business
- Non-Minority Owned Business
- Woman Owned Business
- Disadvantaged Business